
Sign Blanks Street Name Blanks U-Channel Sign Post Premade Signs Total
Signotech Inc. 3,947.75$          571.50$      No Bid 4,897.25$  9,416.50$    

Lowen Corp. 4,488.66$          610.38$      No Bid 7,871.32$  12,970.36$  

Rocal Inc. 5,871.25$          924.25$      No Bid 6,437.15$  13,232.65$  

Perma-line Corp 4,077.75$          541.50$      5,459.00$  6,198.40$  16,276.65$  

Vulcan Signs 4,299.50$          601.00$      7,500.50$  7,003.80$  19,404.80$  

American Fagging+Control,Inc 5,512.50$          1,242.50$  4,747.30$  9,547.00$  21,049.30$  

Mandel Metals, Inc. 3,519.75$          472.00$      No Bid No Bid No bid
DBA US Standard Sign
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