



BID #2020-005 Winter Sand

8/1/2019

	Gendon Aggregate Supply Turner Pit	Gendon Aggregate Supply New Gloucester Pit	K.R. Youland & Son
Item#1 Price per Cubic Yard (delivered)	\$ 10.50	\$ 10.90	\$ 8.50
Item#2 Price per Cubic Yard (picked up)	\$ 8.75	\$ 6.75	\$ 6.50
Item#3 Additional commercial sand available FOB Contractor's site	\$ 8.75	\$ 6.75	\$ 6.50
START DATE	8/1/2019	8/1/2019	10/1/2019

OPTIONAL Second Year

Item#1 Price per Cubic Yard (delivered)	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 9.00
Item#2 Price per Cubic Yard (picked up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 7.00
Item#3 Additional commercial sand available FOB Contractor's site	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 7.00

OPTIONAL Third Year

Item#1 Price per Cubic Yard (delivered)

Item#2 Price per Cubic Yard (picked up)

Item#3 Additional commercial sand available FOB Contractor's site

NO BID	NO BID	\$	9.00
NO BID	NO BID	\$	7.00
NO BID	NO BID	\$	7.00