
BID TITLE:
DUE DATE:
REQUESTING:

Dennis Burke Fabian Oil Irving EnergyPetroleum Traders C N Brown Mansfield Oil
Chelsea MA Oakland ME Portsmouth NH Fort Wayne IN South Paris ME  Gainesville GA

Posted Date

87 Unleaded:
Tank Wagon 2.7193$                2.71650$       
Freight Cost 0.0429$                0.03685$       

Mark-Up 0.0174$                0.03580$       
Total deliv. Rack Plus -$              -$           -$                 2.7796$                2.78915$       -$                

Fixed Rate Alternate 2.8400$       No Bid 2.7393$                n/a No Bid

Diesel:
Tank Wagon 2.8815$                2.93571$       
Freight Cost 0.0482$                0.03809$       

Mark-Up 0.0174$                0.05770$       
Total deliv. Rack Plus -$              -$           -$                 2.9471$                3.03150$       -$                

Fixed Rate Alternate 3.000000$  No Bid 3.0589$                3.1447$          No Bid

GASOLINE AND DIESEL FULES
September 9, 2014 by 10:0  
Auburn School Dept and the Cities of Lewiston and Auburn, Maine

TABULATION



Dead River Downeast M W Sewall
Auburn ME Lisbon Falls ME Bath ME

-$           -$                 -$            

No Bid No Bid No Bid

-$           -$                 -$            

3.1875$    No Bid No Bid


	Sheet1

